82505 opp Athens Janitor Supply Imperial Dade Associated Paper Pacific Star Corp Alantic Paper & Packaging Staples Kamo
Diversey& Deb
Products Make & Make & Make & Make & Make & Make & Make & Make &
Eisimated | pogeigig | CeseCost | EntendedCost | \wiltl | CaseCost | ExtendedCost | yiflfn, | CaseCost | ExtendedCost | ool | CaseCost | ExtendedCost | oot | CaseCost | ExtendedCost | yoifn, | CaseCost | ExtendedCost | picelsi, | CaseCost | ExtendedCost | yeiif. | CaseCost | Extended Cost
Case Quantity
R 132 AsSpec | $16460 $21,727.20 Asspec | $184.67 524,376.44 Asspec | 817635 $23278.20 Asspec | $19831 526176.92 Asspec | 524193 $31934.76 No Bid No Bid NoBid Asspec | $17816 $23517.12 No Bid No Bid NoBid
Diversey Bravo
Heavy Duty Stripper| 10 Asspec | $49.05 $490.50 Asspec | $55.28 $552.60 Asspec | $54.00 54090 Asspec | $60.83 $608.30 Asspec | $13502 $1,350.20 No Bid No Bid NoBid NoBid | NoBid $0.00 No Bid No Bid NoBid
#95115958
Diversey Revive 0
o Asspec | $77.47 $771.70 Asspec | $8453 $845.30 Asspec | $80.89 $808.90 Asspec | $93.69 $936.90 Asspec | $15306 $153060 No Bid No Bid NoBid Asspec | $11548 $1154.80 No Bid No Bid NoBid
TR 9 Asspec | $17130 $16958.70 Asspec | $187.98 51861002 Asspec | $16800 $16,632.00 Asspec | $18891 $18,702.00 Asspec | $234.88 $23253.12 No Bid No Bid NoBid Asspec | $17640 $17,463.60 No Bid No Bid NoBid
Diversey Glance # ’ ’ : :
0075167 66 Asspec | $98.:88 $6,526.08 Asspec | $95.34 $6.292.44 Asspec | $8301 $5538.06 Asspec | $94.38 $6.229.08 Asspec | $16200 $10692.00 NoBid NoBid NoBid Asspec | $96.91 $6.396.06 No Bid No Bid NoBid
Diversey
Prominence # 2 Asspec | $11953 $2390.60 Asspec | $13134 5262680 Asspec | 812571 $2514.20 Asspec | $14138 52,827.60 Asspec | $184.48 $3,689.60 NoBid NoBid NoBid Asspec | $12553 $251060 No Bid No Bid NoBid
94996466
DiemeyFonvadS % E 8 35.86 5 a 8.465.49 s 7694 7,617.06 E 86. 857043 s 2190 2,068.10 id id d sy % 841104 id id d
904965 As Spec $78.14 $7,735. As Spec $85.51 $8,465.4 pec $ 37 As Spec $86.57 $8,570.4: As Spec $121. $12,068.1 No Bic No Bic No Bi As Spec $84. $8,411.04 No Bi No Bi No Bi
DEBHandSoap# | 4,00
UIL NoBid 50.00 $0.00 Asspec | $36.35 4362000 Asspec | $5135 $61,620.00 Asspec | $37.39 $44,868.00 Asspec | $7835 $94,020.00 Asspec | $3552 $42,624.00 Asspec | $55.30 $66,360.00 Asspec | $3489 $41,868.00




